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ANNEX B TECHNICAL REQUIREMENTS  

STAR  EVALUATION 

 

CHICKS Girls and Boys, born 2010 and later  

Free program: max. 2.00 min 

 Single jumps 

 2 different spins (at least 3 revolutions) 

 Axel or double jumps are not allowed 

 

 

CUBS Girls and Boys, born 2009 and later  

Free program: max. 2.30 min 

5 jump elements   

 Max. 2 jump combinations or jump sequences of which max. 1 jump combination may 

consist of 3 jumps 

 should be Axel 

 maximum two double jump  

 3 different spins minimum 4 revolutions 

 Step sequence utilising ½ of the ice surface 

 At least 2 unsupported spiral positions 

Min. 2 unsupported spirals  

Deduction - 0,5 points for each missing spiral (max.- 1.0 points) 
 

 

SPRINGS B Girls and boys, born 2007 and younger  

Free program:  2.30 min (+/- 10sec), vocal music is allowed 

● Max. 5 jump elements 

▪ 1 of which must be single Axel jump. 

▪ At least 1 double jump. All double jumps are allowed. 

▪ Max. 2 jump combinations or jump sequences of which max. 1 jump 
combination may consist of 3 jumps. 

▪ Single or double jumps can be repeated once 

● Max. 2 different spins (every spin has to have different abbreviation!) 

▪ Spin combination (8 revolutions) with or without change of foot. There must 
be at least 2 basic positions at min 2 revolutions. Flying entry not permitted. 

▪ One spin with one position with or without change of foot. Minimum 5 
revolutions, with a change of foot minimum 8 revolutions. Flying entry 
allowed. 

● Step sequence fully utilising the ice surface. 

● Min. 2 spirals on edge. One must be at least 3 sec. 

  Deduction - 0,5 points for each fall and missing or incorrect spiral. 

 

SPRINGS C Girls and boys, born 2007 and younger 

 Free program:  2.30 min (+/- 10sec),  

● Max. 5 jump elements 

▪ 1 of which must be single Axel jump. 

▪ Should contain at least one double jump/attempted double jump,                      
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all double jumps and their attempts are allowed. 

▪ Max. 2 jump combinations or jump sequences of which max. 1 jump 
combination may consist of 3 jumps. 

▪ Single or double jumps can be repeated once 

● Max. 2 different spins (every spin has to have different abbreviation!) 

▪ Spin combination (8 revolutions) with or without change of foot. There must 
be at least 2 basic positions at min 2 revolutions. Flying entry not permitted 

▪ One spin with one position with or without change of foot. Minimum 5 
revolutions, with a change of foot minimum 8 revolutions. Flying entry 
allowed. 

● 1 step sequence fully utilising the ice surface. 

 Min. 2 spirals on edge. One must be at least 3 sec 

  Deduction - 0,5 points for each fall and missing or incorrect spiral. 

 

DEBS C Girls and boys, born 2005 or younger  

Free program: max 3 min 10 s,  

● Max. 6 jump elements 

▪ 1 of which must be Axel jump. 

▪ max. 2 jump combinations or jump sequences of which max. 1 jump 
combination may consist of 3 jumps. 

▪ Single or double jumps can be repeated once. 

● Max. 2 different spins 

▪ Spin combination (8 revolutions) with or without change of foot. Flying entry 
not permitted. 

▪ One spin with one position with or without change of foot. Minimum 5 
revolutions, with a change of foot minimum 8 revolutions. Flying entry 
allowed. 

● 1 Step sequence must fully utilising the ice surface. 

● Min. 2 spirals on edge. One must be at least 3 sec. 

  Deduction - 0,5 points for each fall and missing or incorrect spiral. 

 

NOVICE C Girls and boys, born 1.7.2003 or later 

Free program: max 3 min 10 s,  

● Max. 6 jump elements 

▪ 1 of which must be Axel jump. 

▪ max. 2 jump combinations or jump sequences of which max. 1 jump 
combination may consist of 3 jumps. 

▪ Single or double jumps can be repeated once. 

● Max. 2 different spins 

▪ Spin combination (8 revolutions) with or without change of foot. Flying entry 
not permitted 

▪ One spin with one position with or without change of 

foot. Minimum 5 revolutions, with a change of foot 

minimum 8 revolutions. Flying entry allowed. 

● 1 Step sequence fully utilising the the ice surface. 

● Min. 2 spirals on edge. One must be at least 3 sec. 

  Deduction - 0,5 points for each fall and missing or incorrect spiral. 
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JUNIOR C Ladies and men, born 1999 or later  
 Free program: max 3 min 10 s,  

 Max. 6 jump elements 

▪ 1 of which must be Axel jump. 

▪ max. 2 jump combinations or jump sequences of which max. 1 jump 
combination may consist of 3 jumps. 

▪ Single or double jumps can be repeated once. 

 Max. 2 different spins 

▪ Spin combination (8 revolutions) with or without change of foot. No flying 
entry permitted. 

▪ One spin with one position with or without change of foot. Minimum 5 
revolutions, with a change of foot minimum 8 revolutions. Flying entry 
allowed. 

● 1 Step sequence fully utilising the ice surface. 

● 2 spirals. One must be at least 3 seconds 

   Deduction - 0,5 points for each fall and missing or incorrect spiral. 

 

TAITAJAT/STARLETS, Girls and Boys,  

born 2005-2001 no axel 

born 2006-2009 no axel 

 Free program: max. 2.30 min,  

● Maximum 5 jump elements, no double or triple jumps 

o No axel 

o Single jumps 

o jump combinations or jump sequences of which max. 1 jump combination may consist 

of 3 jumps 

● Maximum 3 spins 

● Step sequence utilising at least ½ of the ice surface 

● At least 2 spirals 

  Deduction - 0,5 points for each missing spiral (max.- 1.0 points) 

  born 2001 or later axel 

Free program: max. 2.30 min, 

 

● Maximum 5 jump elements, no double or triple jumps 

o axel 

o Single jumps 

o jump combinations or jump sequences of which max. 1 jump combination may consist 

of 3 jumps 

● Maximum 3 spins 

● Step sequence utilising at least ½ of the ice surface 

● At least 2 spirals 

Deduction - 0,5 points for each missing spiral (max.- 

1.0 points) 

 

Organiser reserves the right to change the age 

groupings after the entries have been received. 


